

# RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.  
S-115  
Ladysmith, WI 54848



PHONE (715) 532-2113  
FAX (715) 532-2138  
E-MAIL jkoslowski@ruskcountywi.us

## Timber Sale Final Bid Results

Bid Open Date

May 15, 2019

### Tract: 1-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Peter Kron	38,325.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Futurewood Corporation	35,397.25	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Darin Duncan Logging	30,790.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Grindstone Enterprises	27,555.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
Kreier Forest Products	25,805.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Tate VanDeVoort	24,910.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 2-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
NO BID	0.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 3-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Ted Strzok	72,600.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Country Forest Product	69,370.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
R.M. Bay Logging Inc.	66,650.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Travis Krizan	63,075.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Northwest Hardwoods	59,850.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Norton Lumber	53,055.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC	52,700.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Darin Duncan Logging	50,300.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 4-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Norton Lumber	73,940.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Ted Strzok	72,100.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 5-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Ted Strzok	76,510.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Country Forest Product	75,330.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Norton Lumber	72,800.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Northwest Hardwoods	71,805.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 6-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC	34,075.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Tate VanDeVoort	33,420.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 7-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Ted Strzok	40,763.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 8-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Country Forest Product	173,905.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Ted Strzok	157,570.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Darin Duncan Logging	151,397.50	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Northwest Hardwoods	143,785.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Kreier Forest Products	138,625.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

### Tract: 9-19

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Grindstone Enterprises	35,492.50	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Darin Duncan Logging	34,375.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Peter Kron	34,199.20	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Ted Strzok	33,356.20	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC	30,450.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Travis Krizan	30,188.50	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

WB=Winning Bid

Inc=Incomplete Bi

**Tract: 10-19**

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Ted Strzok	185,840.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Norton Lumber	161,120.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Northwest Hardwoods	159,110.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Kreier Forest Products	140,375.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

**Tract: 11-19**

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Ted Strzok	71,610.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Norton Lumber	60,275.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

**Tract: 12-19**

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Northwest Hardwoods	87,325.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Ted Strzok	85,955.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Norton Lumber	79,780.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Darin Duncan Logging	77,345.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Kreier Forest Products	72,910.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

**Tract: 13-19**

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Darin Duncan Logging	107,800.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Ted Strzok	103,410.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

**Tract: 14-19**

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
Northwest Hardwoods	99,235.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Ted Strzok	97,890.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
Team Forestry LLC	92,781.00	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

**Tract: 26-18**

Contractor	Bid Total	WB	Inc
NO BID	0.00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

WB=Winning Bid

Inc=Incomplete Bi

# RUSK COUNTY FOREST ADMINISTRATOR

311 Miner Ave. E.  
S-115  
Ladysmith, WI 54848



PHONE (715) 532-2113  
FAX (715) 532-2138  
E-MAIL jkoslowski@ruskcountywi.us

## Timber Sale Bid Summary

Bid Open Date  
May 15, 2019

Tract#	Acres	Bids	High Bidder	Bid Value	Minimum Bid
1-19	31	6	Peter Kron	38,325.00	24,840.00
2-19	72	1	NO BID	0.00	36,635.00
3-19	90	8	Ted Strzok	72,600.00	44,100.00
4-19	131	2	Norton Lumber	73,940.00	64,700.00
5-19	115	4	Ted Strzok	76,510.00	68,850.00
6-19	61	2	Paul Wojcik, PAW LLC	34,075.00	32,775.00
7-19	104	1	Ted Strzok	40,763.00	28,650.00
8-19	160	5	Country Forest Product	173,905.00	136,075.00
9-19	33	6	Grindstone Enterprises	35,492.50	30,150.00
10-19	195	4	Ted Strzok	185,840.00	139,800.00
11-19	90	2	Ted Strzok	71,610.00	57,350.00
12-19	101	5	Northwest Hardwoods	87,325.00	72,750.00
13-19	195	2	Darin Duncan Logging	107,800.00	101,711.00
14-19	113	3	Northwest Hardwoods	99,235.00	74,125.00
26-18	6	1	NO BID	0.00	3,816.00
Bids:		<b>52</b>	Total Value:	<b>1,097,420.50</b>	<b>916,327.00</b>
Sales:		<b>15</b>			

Species	Volume	UOM	Max Bid	Weighted Average
Aspen Pulp	4,005.00	Cords	48.00	35.98
Basswood Pulp	1,545.00	Cords	44.75	16.28
Birch - White Pulp	50.00	Cords	30.00	27.25
Fir Pulp	135.00	Cords	15.00	12.70
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	11,400.00	Cords	44.75	23.91
Oak Pulp	2,850.00	Cords	28.00	20.89
Red Oak Pulp	595.00	Cords	44.75	20.10
Basswood Sawlogs	260.00	MBF	202.00	149.45
Hard Maple Sawlogs	238.00	MBF	388.00	279.96
Mixed Hardwood Sawlogs	812.00	MBF	305.00	230.25
Red Oak Sawlogs	794.00	MBF	425.00	341.97
White Oak Sawlogs	20.00	MBF	340.00	262.00